
10:30 - 12:30

CSW68 Side Events

CSW68 - 2024

Parallel event: Challenging corporate power to reduce
poverty & strengthen human rights

8:00 - 9:30
Parallel event: From policy to practise: funding locally-
led gender-just climate action

Formal side event: Public participation of women and
girls in all their diversity

Parallel event: Poverty is gendered: Can Women
empowerment alleviate poverty? - Unveiling the
Layers: Exploring the Feminization of Poverty

Briefing for Dutch NGOs at the Permanent
Representation to the UN

Parallel event: Feminist Financing Practices: Funding
Movements to Make Change

Parallel event: Feminist perspectives on socio-
economic post-conflict recovery & peacebuilding

Parallel event: Creative Space: Our Voices Our Futures
– ARTivism in Action

Parallel event: Creative Space: Our Voices Our Futures
– ARTivism in Action

11th MarchTime (EDT)

12th March

8:15 - 9:30

12:00 - 13:30

16:00 - 17:00

13th March

Parallel event: Leaving no one behind vs. pushing
people behind: how can we reach those in the back
first?

11:00 - 12:30

12:30 - 14:00

12:30 - 14:00

13:30 - 19:30

14th March

12:30 - 19:30

Organisation

Feminists for a
Binding Treaty

GAGGA

Kingdom of the
Netherlands, ELC,
WEI

INLW, Asia Pacific
Liberal Women’s
Association 

Akina Mama wa
Afrika, Liliane
Fonds, Oxfam GB,
Wemos 

Alliance for Feminist
Movements, CMI!,
Leading from the
South, Netherlands.

Just Future

OVOF

OVOF

Netherlands,
WO=MEN, Atria

Creative Space: Movie Night - Crossings17:30 - 19:30 OVOF

https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-challenging-corporate-power-to-reduce-poverty-strengthen-human-rights
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-from-policy-to-practice-funding-locally-led-gender-just-climate-action
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-formal-side-event-public-participation-of-women-and-girls-in-all-their-diversity
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-panel-discussion-poverty-is-gendered-can-women-empowerment-alleviate-poverty-unveiling-the-layers-exploring-the-feminization-of-poverty
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-briefing-for-ngo-s-new-york
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-leaving-no-one-behind-vs-pushing-people-behind-how-can-we-reach-those-in-the-back-first
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-feminist-financing-practices-funding-movements-to-make-change
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-feminist-perspectives-on-socio-economic-post-conflict-recovery-peacebuilding
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-creative-space-our-voices-our-futures-artivism-in-action
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-creative-space-our-voices-our-futures-artivism-in-action-1
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-creative-space-movie-night-crossings


10:30 - 12:00

CSW68 Side Events

CSW68 - 2024

Parallel event: Is technology facilitated gender-based
violence real?

11:00 - 12:30
Parallel event: Women and financial independency in
the Netherlands

Parallel event: Breaking the chain of violence through
economic empowerment

Parallel event: Hidden Hours: Feminist Solutions to
Energy, Water & Menstrual Poverty

Parallel event: Powerful Path to Peace: Women’s
Leadership in Non-Violent Protest Movements

15th MarchTime (EDT)

14:30 - 16:00

8:30 - 10:20

8:30 - 10:30

16:45 - 18:00

19th March

Parallel event: Fragile contexts, strong women: The
role of religious leaders and faith-based organizations
in promoting women’s leadership

21th March

Parallel event: African Sisterhood as a Business
Development Model: Financial Equity and Restorative
Justice

14:00 - 15:30

22th March
Parallel event: Imagining and building inclusive
feminist economies

12:30 - 14:00

Organisation
Rutgers

Nederlandse
Vrouwenraad

Global Network of
Women’s Shelters

WECF

PAX

Caritas 
Internationalis

Global African
Sheroes Union

CMI!, Power Up!

20th March

Parallel event: Poverty? Or impoverishment? LGBTIQ+
people’s economic agency through a class-lens

COC14:30 - 16:00

Parallel event: Youth-friendly feminist funding14:30 - 16:00 CHOICE, AMREF

Webinar Alliance Politica: making political
participation work worldwide

15:00 - 16:15 Alliance Politica

Parallel event: Bridging Gaps for Sustainable Peace:
Feminist Financing Mechanisms to Address
Inequality and the Root Causes of Conflict

12:30 - 14:00

Asia Peoples’
Movement on Debt
and Development,
OXFAM, WIPC

https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-is-technology-facilitated-gender-based-violence-real
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-women-and-financial-independency-in-the-netherlands
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-breaking-the-chain-of-violence-through-economic-empowerment
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-hidden-hours-feminist-solutions-to-energy-water-menstrual-poverty
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-powerful-path-to-peace-women-s-leadership-in-non-violent-protest-movements
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-webinar-alliance-politica-making-political-participation-work-worldwide-1
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-bridging-gaps-for-sustainable-peace-feminist-financing-mechanisms-to-address-inequality-and-the-root-causes-of-conflict
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-fragile-contexts-strong-women-the-role-of-religious-leaders-and-faith-based-organizations-in-promoting-women-s-leadership
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-youth-friendly-feminist-funding
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw-parallel-event-poverty-or-impoverishment-lgbtiq-people-s-economic-agency-through-a-class-lens
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-african-sisterhood-as-a-business-development-model-financial-equity-and-restorative-justice-1
https://www.wo-men.nl/agenda-item/csw68-parallel-event-imagining-and-building-inclusive-feminist-economies

